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Paper Acceptance Notification IJCIET/09/05/2018/IJCIET_11314

3 messages

Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> Wed, May 16, 2018 at 1:07 PM
To: basukia@ft.untar.ac.id, latief73@eng.ui.ac.id, kmochtar3@yahoo.com

Dear Basuki Anondho, Yusuf Latief and Khrisna M

We would like to inform you that your paper titled "PROBABILISTIC DURATION
CALCULATION BASED ON EARNED SCHEDULE APPROACH"” has been accepted
for publication in International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology
(IJCIET), Volume 9, Issue 5, (May 2018) issue of the journal based on the
Recommendation of the Editorial Board without any major corrections in the content
submitted by the researcher.

This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.

Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons Attribution 4.0
(International) License. (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no need to submit the
Copyright form.

Your research paper will be appearing in IJCIET, Volume 9, Issue 5, May 2018.
International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET)

Journal Impact Factor (2016): 9.7820 Calculated by GISI

ISSN Print: 0976 - 6308

ISSN Online: 0976 - 6316

Review Comments are attached along with the mail.

Kindly send the Publication fee of $ 575/- (Including 28% Tax) (Online only).
The Online Only mode includes online publication of paper, indexing of paper in more

than 20 search engines and soft copy of the publication certificate.

You can transfer the money and send the scan copy of payment made evidence
through e-mail.

Account Details

Account Number 1911683597

Name of the Account IAEME Publication

Bank Kotak Mahindra Bank Ltd

Branch T. Nagar Branch

Address of the Bank Ground Floor, Shree Essarar Towers, 41
Venkatnarayana Road, T.Nagar, Chennai -

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1600599756578643490&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f:1600599756...  1/6
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600017, Tamil Nadu, India

Type of Account

Current

Swift Code KKBKINBB
IFSC CODE KKBK0000468
MICR CODE 600485008

Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive the payment

from your side at the earliest.

Thank you.
Yours Sincerely,

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc

Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
Plot: 03, Flat- S 1,

Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment
Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6" Street

Jai Shankar Nagar

Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041
Tamilnadu, India, Mobile: 09884798314

E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com
Website: www.iaeme.com

2 attachments

@ IJCIET_11314_Acceptance-Letter.pdf

81K

ﬂ IJCIET_11314_Review-Report.pdf
61K

basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

To: "Chief Editor, IAEME Journals" <editor@iaeme.com>

Dear Mr./Mrs,

Fri, May 18, 2018 at 12:09 PM

First of all, I would like to thank to the paper acceptance in IJCIET/09/05/2018/IJCIET 11314 and reviewed

as outstanding to the paper.

Regarding to the paper, if I allowed by editors, I would like to correct a misspelling mistake for the third
author. The correct one is as follow should be Basuki Anondho, Yusuf Latief, and Krishna M.
In that case, I send you the full paper and its corrections with this email.

Thank you for your help and attention.

Best Regards,
Basuki Anondho

On Wed, May 16, 2018 at 1:07 PM, Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:
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Dear Basuki Anondho, Yusuf Latief and Khrisna M

We would like to inform you that your paper titled "PROBABILISTIC DURATION
CALCULATION BASED ON EARNED SCHEDULE APPROACH” has been accepted
for publication in International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology
(IJCIET), Volume 9, Issue 5, (May 2018) issue of the journal based on the
Recommendation of the Editorial Board without any major corrections in the content
submitted by the researcher.

This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.

Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons Attribution 4.0
(International) License. (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no need to submit the
Copyright form.

Your research paper will be appearing in IJCIET, Volume 9, Issue 5, May 2018.
International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET)

Journal Impact Factor (2016): 9.7820 Calculated by GISI

ISSN Print: 0976 - 6308

ISSN Online: 0976 - 6316

Review Comments are attached along with the mail.

Kindly send the Publication fee of $ 575/~ (Including 28% Tax) (Online only).
The Online Only mode includes online publication of paper, indexing of paper in more

than 20 search engines and soft copy of the publication certificate.

You can transfer the money and send the scan copy of payment made evidence
through e-mail.

Account Details

Account Number 1911683597

Name of the Account IAEME Publication

Bank Kotak Mahindra Bank Ltd

Branch T. Nagar Branch

Address of the Bank Ground Floor, Shree Essarar Towers, 41

Venkatnarayana Road, T.Nagar, Chennai -
600017, Tamil Nadu, India

Type of Account Current

Swift Code KKBKINBB
IFSC CODE KKBK0000468
MICR CODE 600485008
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Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive the
payment from your side at the earliest.

Thank you.
Yours Sincerely,

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor

IAEME Publication

Plot: 03, Flat-S 1,

Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment
Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6" Street

Jai Shankar Nagar

Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041
Tamilnadu, India, Mobile: 09884798314
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com

Website: www.iaeme.com

@ IJCIET 5-18-2018.pdf
277K

Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> Fri, May 18, 2018 at 5:21 PM

To: basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

Dear Sir

ok. Accepted your correction and noted. After paying the publication fee, kindly inform
us.

Thanks

On Fri, May 18, 2018 at 10:39 AM, basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Mr./Mrs,

First of all, I would like to thank to the paper acceptance in IJCIET/09/05/2018/IJCIET 11314 and
reviewed as outstanding to the paper.

Regarding to the paper, if I allowed by editors, I would like to correct a misspelling mistake for the third
author. The correct one is as follow should be Basuki Anondho, Yusuf Laticf, and Krishna M.
In that case, I send you the full paper and its corrections with this email.

Thank you for your help and attention.

Best Regards,
Basuki Anondho

On Wed, May 16, 2018 at 1:07 PM, Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:

Dear Basuki Anondho, Yusuf Latief and Khrisna M

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1600599756578643490&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f: 1600599756...
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We would like to inform you that your paper titled "PROBABILISTIC DURATION
CALCULATION BASED ON EARNED SCHEDULE APPROACH"” has been
accepted for publication in International Journal of Civil Engineering and
Technology (IJCIET), Volume 9, Issue 5, (May 2018) issue of the journal based
on the Recommendation of the Editorial Board without any major corrections in the
content submitted by the researcher.

This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.

Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons Attribution 4.0
(International) License. (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no need to submit the
Copyright form.

Your research paper will be appearing in IJCIET, Volume 9, Issue 5, May 2018.
International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET)

Journal Impact Factor (2016): 9.7820 Calculated by GISI

ISSN Print: 0976 - 6308

ISSN Online: 0976 - 6316

Review Comments are attached along with the mail.

Kindly send the Publication fee of $ 575/~ (Including 28%0 Tax) (Online only).
The Online Only mode includes online publication of paper, indexing of paper in

more than 20 search engines and soft copy of the publication certificate.

You can transfer the money and send the scan copy of payment made evidence
through e-mail.

Account Details

Account Number 1911683597

Name of the Account IAEME Publication

Bank Kotak Mahindra Bank Ltd

Branch T. Nagar Branch

Address of the Bank Ground Floor, Shree Essarar Towers, 41

Venkatnarayana Road, T.Nagar, Chennai -
600017, Tamil Nadu, India

Type of Account Current

Swift Code KKBKINBB
IFSC CODE KKBK0000468
MICR CODE 600485008

Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive the
payment from your side at the earliest.

Thank you.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1600599756578643490&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f:1600599756...  5/6



08/11/23, 12.25

Yours Sincerely,

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor

IAEME Publication

Plot: 03, Flat-S 1,

Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment
Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6" Street

Jai Shankar Nagar

Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041
Tamilnadu, India, Mobile: 09884798314
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com

Website: www.iaeme.com

Dr .S. Balasubramanian
Chief Editor

IAEME Publication
www.iaeme.com

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1600599756578643490&dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f: 1600599756....
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: U N T A R basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

Goes to Google Apps

Reminder Paper Acceptance Notification IJCIET/09/05/2018/IJCIET_11314

1 message

Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> Mon, May 28, 2018 at 4:45 PM
To: basukia@ft.untar.ac.id, latief73@eng.ui.ac.id, kmochtar3@yahoo.com

Dear Basuki Anondho, Yusuf Latief and Khrisna M

As you aware that, your paper has accepted for publication in our journal and
acceptance letter send to your e-mail address.

But still now, we are not received the Publication fee after the acceptance letter
issued by IAEME. Kindly send it immediately, so that we can publish your paper
in this issue. If you are not interested to publish, kindly inform us. We are
waiting for your response.

Thanks and Regards

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc

President & Chief Editor

IAEME

Plot : 03, Flat- S 1, Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment
Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6th Street

Jai Shankar Nagar, Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041

(If you completed the payment procedures please ighore this message)

Thank You

On Wed, May 16, 2018 at 11:37 AM, Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:

Dear Basuki Anondho, Yusuf Latief and Khrisna M

We would like to inform you that your paper titled "PROBABILISTIC DURATION
CALCULATION BASED ON EARNED SCHEDULE APPROACH"” has been accepted
for publication in International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology
(IJCIET), Volume 9, Issue 5, (May 2018) issue of the journal based on the
Recommendation of the Editorial Board without any major corrections in the content
submitted by the researcher.

This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.

Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons Attribution 4.0
(International) License. (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no need to submit the

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1601700584580183852&simpl=msg-f:16017005845801838...  1/3



08/11/23, 12.26 Tarumanagara University Mail - Reminder Paper Acceptance Notification IJCIET/09/05/2018/IJCIET_11314

Copyright form.

Your research paper will be appearing in IJCIET, Volume 9, Issue 5, May 2018.
International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET)

Journal Impact Factor (2016): 9.7820 Calculated by GISI

ISSN Print: 0976 - 6308

ISSN Online: 0976 - 6316

Review Comments are attached along with the mail.

Kindly send the Publication fee of $ 575/- (Including 28% Tax) (Online only).
The Online Only mode includes online publication of paper, indexing of paper in more

than 20 search engines and soft copy of the publication certificate.

You can transfer the money and send the scan copy of payment made evidence
through e-mail.

Account Details

Account Number 1911683597

Name of the Account IAEME Publication

Bank Kotak Mahindra Bank Ltd

Branch T. Nagar Branch

Address of the Bank Ground Floor, Shree Essarar Towers, 41

Venkatnarayana Road, T.Nagar, Chennai -
600017, Tamil Nadu, India

Type of Account Current

Swift Code KKBKINBB
IFSC CODE KKBK0000468
MICR CODE 600485008

Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive the
payment from your side at the earliest.

Thank you.
Yours Sincerely,

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor

IAEME Publication

Plot: 03, Flat-S 1,

Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment
Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6" Street

Jai Shankar Nagar

Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041
Tamilnadu, India, Mobile: 09884798314

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1601700584580183852&simpl=msg-f:16017005845801838...  2/3
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E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com
Website: www.iaeme.com

Dr .S. Balasubramanian
Chief Editor

IAEME Publication
www.iaeme.com

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1601700584580183852&simpl=msg-f:16017005845801838...  3/3
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basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

Goes to Google Apps

Payment process
3 messages

basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id> Tue, May 29, 2018 at 3:18 PM
To: iaemedu@gmail.com

To:

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc

Chief Editor

IAEME Publication

Plot: 03, Flat-S 1,

Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment

Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6th Street

Jai Shankar Nagar

Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041
Tamilnadu, India, Mobile: 09884798314

Dear Sirs,

I'm sorry for late payment of my paper.
The payment should be executed by my Institution on:

Wenesday, May, 30rd, 2018

It"s my mistake by give you late information, since | need a confirmation from my institution.
Thank You for your kindness

Best Regards

Basuki Anondho

Jakarta, Indonesia

Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <iaemedu@gmail.com> Tue, May 29, 2018 at 9:15 PM
To: basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

Dear Sir

ok. No issue at all. After paying the fee, kindly inform us.

Thanks

[Quoted text hidden]

Thanking you,

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian B.E, M.Tech, MBA, Ph.D

Chief Editor

IAEME Journals

www.iaeme.com

e-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com

editor@iaeme.com

Google Scholar Citation: https://scholar.google.co.in/citations?user=1f _3w1gAAAAJ&hl=en
Thomson Reuters' Research ID : H-3771-2015 Indexed Journals

IAEME Publication ResearchGate Profile

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a:mmiai-r293374279191398390&simpl=msg-a:s:-550146281...

172



08/11/23, 12.27 Tarumanagara University Mail - Payment process

basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id> Wed, May 30, 2018 at 10:05 AM
To: "Chief Editor, IAEME Journals" <iaemedu@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,

I've already executed the payment for paper:" Probabilistic Duration Calculation Based on Earned Schedule Approah" for
isIfl?Payment conducted through BNI 46 bank to your adrresed Bank.

Please check it out to confirm the payment.

| sent you also the copy of bank note as attachment.

Thank you for your help ad patient.

Best Regards

Basuk Anondho
[Quoted text hidden]

@ IAEME PAYMENT.pdf
608K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a:mmiai-r293374279191398390&simpl=msg-a:s:-550146281...  2/2
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basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

Goes to Google Apps

Received the payment made evidence
1 message

Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <iaemedu@gmail.com> Wed, May 30, 2018 at 2:25 PM
To: basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

Dear Sir/Madam

Received the payment made evidence. Normally all foreign transaction will take
3 to 5 days time period to credit the money into our account. After receiving the

money, paper will be published in online. We will inform the status
Thanks

On Wed, May 30, 2018 at 8:35 AM, basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Sir,

I've already executed the payment for paper:" Probabilistic Duration Calculation Based on Earned Schedule Approah”
for $575

The Payment conducted through BNI 46 bank to your adrresed Bank.

Please check it out to confirm the payment.

| sent you also the copy of bank note as attachment.

Thank you for your help ad patient.

Best Regards

Basuk Anondho

On Tue, May 29, 2018 at 9:15 PM, Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <iaemedu@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sir
ok. No issue at all. After paying the fee, kindly inform us.
Thanks

On Tue, May 29, 2018 at 1:48 PM, basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id> wrote:
To:

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor

IAEME Publication

Plot: 03, Flat-S 1,

Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment
Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6" Street

Jai Shankar Nagar

Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041
Tamilnadu, India, Mobile: 09884798314

Dear Sirs,
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1601872986053274145&simpl=msg-f:16018729860532741...  1/2



08/11/23, 12.27 Tarumanagara University Mail - Received the payment made evidence

I'm sorry for late payment of my paper.
The payment should be executed by my Institution on:

Wenesday, May, 30rd, 2018

It"s my mistake by give you late information, since | need a confirmation from my institution.
Thank You for your kindness

Best Regards

Basuki Anondho

Jakarta, Indonesia

Thanking you,

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian B.E, M.Tech, MBA, Ph.D

Chief Editor

IAEME Journals

www.iaeme.com

e-mail: isemedu@gmail.com

editor@iaeme.com

Google Scholar Citation: https://scholar.google.co.in/citations?user=1f_3w1gAAAAJ&hl=en
Thomson Reuters' Research ID : H-3771-2015 Indexed Journals

IAEME Publication ResearchGate Profile

Thanking you,

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian B.E, M.Tech, MBA, Ph.D

Chief Editor

IAEME Journals

www.iaeme.com

e-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com

editor@iaeme.com

Google Scholar Citation: https://scholar.google.co.in/citations?user=1f_3w1gAAAAJ&hl=en
Thomson Reuters' Research ID : H-3771-2015 Indexed Journals

IAEME Publication ResearchGate Profile

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1601872986053274145&simpl=msg-f:16018729860532741...
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basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

Goes to Google Apps

Received the publication fee
1 message

Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> Thu, May 31, 2018 at 6:43 PM
To: basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

Dear Sir/Madam

Received the publication fee. Within 2 days time period, paper will be formatted
as per our journal format and you will get the email from our editing Department
for the same. Thanks for your prompt response.

On Fri, May 18, 2018 at 3:51 PM, Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:
Dear Sir
ok. Accepted your correction and noted. After paying the publication fee, kindly inform
us.
Thanks

On Fri, May 18, 2018 at 10:39 AM, basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Mr./Mrs,

First of all, I would like to thank to the paper acceptance in [JCIET/09/05/2018/1JCIET 11314 and
reviewed as outstanding to the paper.

Regarding to the paper, if I allowed by editors, I would like to correct a misspelling mistake for the third
author. The correct one is as follow should be Basuki Anondho, Yusuf Latief, and Krishna M.
In that case, I send you the full paper and its corrections with this email.

Thank you for your help and attention.

Best Regards,
Basuki Anondho

On Wed, May 16, 2018 at 1:07 PM, Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:

Dear Basuki Anondho, Yusuf Latief and Khrisna M

We would like to inform you that your paper titled “"PROBABILISTIC
DURATION CALCULATION BASED ON EARNED SCHEDULE APPROACH” has
been accepted for publication in International Journal of Civil Engineering
and Technology (IJCIET), Volume 9, Issue 5, (May 2018) issue of the journal
based on the Recommendation of the Editorial Board without any major
corrections in the content submitted by the researcher.

This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1601979842214727370&simpl=msg-f:16019798422147273...
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08/11/23, 12.27 Tarumanagara University Mail - Received the publication fee

Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons Attribution
4.0 (International) License. (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no need to submit the
Copyright form.

Your research paper will be appearing in IJCIET, Volume 9, Issue 5, May 2018.
International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET)
Journal Impact Factor (2016): 9.7820 Calculated by GISI

ISSN Print: 0976 - 6308

ISSN Online: 0976 - 6316

Review Comments are attached along with the mail.

Kindly send the Publication fee of $ 575/- (Including 28% Tax) (Online
only). The Online Only mode includes online publication of paper, indexing of

paper in more than 20 search engines and soft copy of the publication certificate.

You can transfer the money and send the scan copy of payment made evidence
through e-mail.

Account Details

Account Number 1911683597

Name of the Account IAEME Publication

Bank Kotak Mahindra Bank Ltd

Branch T. Nagar Branch

Address of the Bank Ground Floor, Shree Essarar Towers, 41

Venkatnarayana Road, T.Nagar, Chennai -
600017, Tamil Nadu, India

Type of Account Current

Swift Code KKBKINBB
IFSC CODE KKBK0000468
MICR CODE 600485008

Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive the
payment from your side at the earliest.

Thank you.
Yours Sincerely,

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor

IAEME Publication

Plot: 03, Flat-S 1,

Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment

Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6" Street

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1601979842214727370&simpl=msg-f:16019798422147273...  2/3
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Jai Shankar Nagar

Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041
Tamilnadu, India, Mobile: 09884798314
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com

Website: www.iaeme.com

Tarumanagara University Mail - Received the publication fee

Dr .S. Balasubramanian
Chief Editor

IAEME Publication
www.iaeme.com

Dr .S. Balasubramanian
Chief Editor

IAEME Publication
www.iaeme.com

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=001766b576&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1601979842214727370&simpl=msg-f:16019798422147273...  3/3



08/11/23, 12.28 Tarumanagara University Mail - Paper Published in Online- IJCIET- Volume 9, Issue 5, 2018

U N T A R basuki anondho <basukia@ft.untar.ac.id>

Goes to Google Apps

Paper Published in Online- IJCIET- Volume 9, Issue 5, 2018

1 message

IAEME Editing Department <editing@iaeme.com> Fri, Jun 1, 2018 at 8:36 PM
To: basukia@ft.untar.ac.id, latief73@eng.ui.ac.id, kmochtar3@yahoo.com

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Your article published in International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET), Volume 9,
Issue 5, May, 2018 and attached the file for your reference. Kindly download the paper from the website
www.iaeme.com.

Papers Title:
PROBABILISTIC DURATION CALCULATION BASED ON EARNED SCHEDULE APPROACH

Issue Link:
http://www.iaeme.coml/ijciet/issues.asp?VType=9&IType=5&JType=IJCIET&PageNumber=3
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